
 

 

MEMORANDUM  
 

To: Dr. Mark Light 
From: Mallory Rubin 
Subject: Agency Choice 
Date: January 14, 2015 

Introduction 
 
For the Strategic Planning project, I chose to study Hubbard Street Dance Company. 
Hubbard Street meets the characteristics that are required for the project. With my 
dance background, I am interested in analyzing a dance organization and meeting 
contacts in the arts field. In this memo, I will describe the organization and explain why it 
meets the selection rationale  

 
Organization Description 

 
Hubbard Street Dance Company is a nonprofit dance organization based in Chicago. 
Hubbard Street’s mission is to “bring artists, art and audiences together to enrich, 
engage, educate, transform, and change lives through the experience of dance” 
(Hubbard Street Dance Chicago, 2015, Company History section). Hubbard Street 
fulfills this mission through its professional performing companies, dance studio, and 
community outreach programs.  
 

Selection Rationale 
 
Hubbard Street fits the required agency characteristics. Hubbard Street is located in the 
West side of Chicago. I have access to three recent contiguous IRS 990 forms. I have 
included the three 990 forms in the Appendix. Hubbard Street’s revenue in the fiscal 
year 2012-2013 was $5,657,683. Hubbard Street employs over 30 full-time staff. 
Hubbard Street had positive net assets of $7,185,372 in the fiscal year 2012-2013. 
 
Hubbard Street mostly fits the ideal agency selection criteria. I have taken dance 
classes at the studio and have watched performance videos online. I do not have a 
contact at the organization, but I would like to use this project as an opportunity to meet 
staff members. Hubbard Street has a comprehensive website, and I have access to the 
annual reports.  
 

Summary 
 
Hubbard Street Dance Company meets the selection criteria for the Strategic Planning 
project. I aspire to work in an arts organization in the future. By analyzing Hubbard 
Street, I will gain insight into strategizing for an arts nonprofit organization.   
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